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Branson Best Western Hotels Receive Awards 
	
	
BRANSON, MO- The Best Western Center Pointe Inn and the Best Western Music Capital Inn are 
both recipients of prestigious awards from Best Western International.  
 
The Best Western Center Pointe Inn received the 2019 Housekeeping Award.  This award 
showcases the dedication from the staff of the housekeeping department to ensure the best 
possible stay for each guest.  Along with this award, the Best Western Center Pointe Inn has 
also been a recipient of the Best Western International Director’s Award, showcasing the 
property’s commitment to great service.  
 
The Best Western Music Capital Inn was awarded the 2018 Best Western International’s 
Director’s Award.  This is the fourth time the hotel has received this award.  The Best Western 
International Director’s Award recognizes hotels scoring in the top 20 percent of more than 
2400 North American properties in cleanliness and maintenance.  Hotels must also meet Best 
Western’s requirements for design and high customer service scores to qualify for the 
distinction.  The Best Western Music Capital Inn has also been a recent recipient of the 
Champion Green Award for their commitment to sustaining resource and has been recognized 
numerous times by Trip Advisor for quality excellence. 
 
“It is an honor to receive both of these prestigious awards from Best Western International. 
These awards display the staff’s hard work and dedication to providing superior customer 
service,” said Chris Myer, Vice President of Marketing for Myer Hotels. 
 
The Best Western Center Pointe Inn is located in the heart of Branson on Highway 76, next to 
the Titanic Museum and across from the Clay Cooper Theatre.  The Best Western Music Capital 
Inn is located on Branson’s Shepherd of the Hills Expressway, next to the Pierce Arrow Theater, 
and within walking distance to several other theaters and restaurants. 
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About Myer Hotels 
In the lodging business for over 50 years, the Myer family has actively contributed to Branson’s 
hospitality market for over 35 years and received numerous national awards. Myer Hotels also 
includes the Comfort Inn & Suites Branson Meadows, Comfort Inn at Thousand Hills, Holiday 
Inn Express Green Mtn. Drive, and the Quality Inn West. For more information about these 
hotels please visit www.myerhospitality.com. 


